
OPENS: 7/26/01 ITB #312-8525
Vibratory Roller

ITEM

1) Vibratory Tandem Roller $25,475.00 $27,799.00 $25,000.00 $24,599.00

2) OPTIONAL - Trailer $4,725.00 $3,850.00 No Bid No Bid

    TOTAL (with optional trailer) $30,200.00 $31,649.00 $25,000.00 $24,599.00

Warranty 1YR

(1)  Apparent low bidder - Roller only
(2) Apparent low bidder - Roller/Trailer

BIDS NOTIFICATIONS 26
BIDS RECEIVED 9

NO BIDS 1

Briggs Equipment, West Palm Beach, FL Walker Miller Equipment, Orlando, FL L & L Worldwide, Lake Park, FL Linder Industrial Machinery, 
Pembroke Pines, FL (1)

HAMM HD 12 Multiquip/Rammax  T-26 Terex/BenFord  TV1200 Ingersolll-Rand  DD-24
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OPENS: 7/26/01 ITB #312-8525
Vibratory Roller

ITEM

1) Vibratory Tandem Roller

2) OPTIONAL - Trailer 

    TOTAL (with optional trailer)

Warranty

(1)  Apparent low bidder - Roller only
(2) Apparent low bidder - Roller/Trailer

BIDS NOTIFICATIONS
BIDS RECEIVED

NO BIDS

No Bid $25,950.00 $27,285.00 $26,536.00 $33,394.00

$5,703.00 No Bid $2,880.00 No Bid $3,233.00

$25,950.00 $30,165.00 $26,536.00 $36,627.00

Discount Rental & Sales, West 
Palm Beach, FL

Ingersoll-Rand DD-24

Kelly Tractor, Miami, FL

Caterpillar CB 224D

Blanchard Machinery, Inc.,  
North Miami, FL

Ingersoll-Rand   DD-24

Nortrax Equipment Co., 
Pompano Beach, FL (2)

Bomag  BW 120AD-3

Ringhaver Equipment Co., 
Tampa, FL
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