Bid Tabulation [
Bid 612-8358 \
Ductile Iron Pipe and Fittings
Opening Date: 8/28/00

A&B Pipe Corcel Ferguson Hughes Lion us

& Supply Corp. Underground Supply Plumbing Filter

(MBE) (MBE/WBE)

Unit Unit Unit Unit Unit Unit

Quantity Price Extension Price Extension Price Extension Price Extension Price Extension Price Extension

Pipe, DI, 16"x18' 54 34.66 1,871.64 34.30] 1,852.20 29.15 1,574.10 NO BID |NO BID 46.40| 2,505.60 31.68 1,710.72
Mfg.: McWane US Pipe & Foundry American Cast Iron Pipe Griffin Pipe Clow
Warranty: 1 Year 1 Year As Per Attached N/A Factory
Sleeve, TrimType LP, 16" 5 197.76 988.80 265.00) 1,325.00 198.00| 990.00 NO BID |NO BID 310.00 1,550.00 195.25 976.25
Mfg.: Union Foundry US Pipe & Foundry Union Foundry/Tyler Sigma Union
Warranty: 1 Year 1 Year As Per Attached 1 Year Factory
Galve Valve, 16 5 2,520.00, 12,600.00 3,280.00, 16,400.00 2,550.00| 12,750.00 2,394.75 11,973.75 1,745.00| 8,725.00 2,665.00, 13,325.00
Mfg.: Mueller US Pipe & Foundry American Flow Control Mueller Natco-Norca Clow
Warranty: 10 Years 1 Year As Per Attached As Per Attached 1 Year Factory
Total 15,460.44 19,577.20 15,314.10 11,973.75 12,780.60 16,011.97
Number of bids solicited/received: 12/6
NO BIDS: 1/Do Not Offer
MBE: 3/2] [
WBE: 1/1] |




