
Bid #662-9335 - Police Equipment
 

Creation Date  Nov 28, 2005 End Date Dec 22, 2005 2:00:00 PM EST

Start Date Dec 8, 2005 4:15:20 PM EST Awarded Date  Not Yet Awarded

 662-9335-1-01   Streamline Flashlight

 Vendor Unit Price  Qty/Unit Total Price  Attch.  Docs

KIESLERS POLICE SUPPLY  First Offer - $0.00   5 / each $0.00    Y

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 
Vendor Notes:
NO BID ITEM NUMBER IS FOR IS H&K'S NUMBER 
COULD 
NOT BID ALTERNATE WITHOUT MORE INFO   

Safety and Security International  First Offer - $0.00   5 / each $0.00    Y

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 
Vendor Notes:
no bid this item   

Law Enforcement Sales, USA  First Offer - $139.80   5 / each $699.00    Y

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 69087
Vendor Notes:
M2 no longer available, substitute M3 w/adapter   

Lawmens & Shooters Supply, Inc. [Ad]
 

 
First Offer - $146.19   5 / each $730.95    Y

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 69025
Vendor Notes:
Streamlight   

Lous Police Security Equipment  First Offer - $147.98   5 / each $739.90    Y

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 
Vendor Notes:
 

Pines Police Supply  First Offer - $149.00   5 / each $745.00    Y

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 
Vendor Notes:
Streamlight no longer makes an m2 but they do 
make the M3 w/adapter   

Pines Police Supply  Alt 2 - $149.00   5 / each $745.00    Y

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 69087
Vendor Notes:
 

Botach Tactical [Ad]   First Offer - $156.40   5 / each $782.00    Y

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 
Vendor Notes:
 

worldwide tactical LLC  First Offer - $161.90   5 / each $809.50    Y

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: m-2/utl
Vendor Notes:
 

Product Wizard  First Offer - $171.90   5 / each $859.50    Y

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: M2/UTL 69051
Vendor Notes:
 

Martronics, Inc.  First Offer - $176.98   5 / each $884.90    Y

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: m-2/utl
Vendor Notes:
 

W.S. Darley & Co.  First Offer - $192.00   5 / each $960.00    Y

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 69051
Vendor Notes:
 

City of Fort Lauderdale

Feb 27, 2006 3:54:00 PM EST p. 1



Galls  First Offer - $199.00   5 / each $995.00    Y

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: FL448 DS
Vendor Notes:
30 day lead time for delivery. Drop-ship item.   

 662-9335-1-02   Tactical Glove

 Vendor Unit Price  Qty/Unit Total Price  Attch.  Docs

Evergreen Specialty Services  First Offer - $23.49   50 / each $1,174.50    Y

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 
Vendor Notes:
Price is for Damascus Glove, model#DSO100   

Botach Tactical [Ad]   First Offer - $28.85   50 / each $1,442.50    Y

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 
Vendor Notes:
 

worldwide tactical LLC  First Offer - $30.98   50 / each $1,549.00    Y

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: SOG-L100
Vendor Notes:
 

Law Enforcement Sales, USA  First Offer - $33.93   50 / each $1,696.50    Y

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: Hatch SOG-L 100
Vendor Notes:
 

Lawmens & Shooters Supply, Inc. [Ad]
 

 
First Offer - $33.98   50 / each $1,699.00    Y

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: SOG-L
Vendor Notes:
Hatch   

Pines Police Supply  First Offer - $34.50   50 / each $1,725.00    Y

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: sog-l100
Vendor Notes:
 

Lous Police Security Equipment  First Offer - $36.16   50 / each $1,808.00    Y

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 
Vendor Notes:
 

Safety and Security International  First Offer - $37.50   50 / each $1,875.00    Y

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 
Vendor Notes:
Bidding Hatch SOGL100   

Galls  First Offer - $38.00   50 / each $1,900.00    Y

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: ZQ769 BLK
Vendor Notes:
Some in stock. 30 day lead time for delivery. Special 
order item.   

KIESLERS POLICE SUPPLY  First Offer - $40.25   50 / each $2,012.50    Y

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: SOG-L100
Vendor Notes:
HATCH   

 662-9335-1-03   Helmet

 Vendor Unit Price  Qty/Unit Total Price  Attch.  Docs

KIESLERS POLICE SUPPLY  First Offer - $0.00   20 / each $0.00    Y

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 
Vendor Notes:
NO BID   

Evergreen Specialty Services  First Offer - $209.00   20 / each $4,180.00    Y

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 
Vendor Notes:
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Price offered is for United Shield, model# PST-650. 
Made in USA   

Helmet Pro  First Offer - $214.80   20 / each $4,296.00    Y

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: BA/3ACTC
Vendor Notes:
 

Safety and Security International  First Offer - $221.25   20 / each $4,425.00    Y

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 
Vendor Notes:
Bidding Bell Pro Police BA3A   

Botach Tactical [Ad]   First Offer - $224.25   20 / each $4,485.00    Y

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 
Vendor Notes:
 

Lawmens & Shooters Supply, Inc. [Ad]
 

 
First Offer - $243.00   20 / each $4,860.00    Y

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: PASGT
Vendor Notes:
RBR Armor   

worldwide tactical LLC  First Offer - $249.00   20 / each $4,980.00    Y

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: PASGT LEVEL 3A
Vendor Notes:
 

Galls  First Offer - $262.00   20 / each $5,240.00    Y

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: TE345
Vendor Notes:
 

Lous Police Security Equipment  First Offer - $288.00   20 / each $5,760.00    Y

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 774
Vendor Notes:
BIDDING: PROTECH DELTA 4 COMBAT LEVEL IIIA 
BALLISTIC HELMET PRODUCT#774   

 662-9335-1-04   Helmet Suspension System
 Vendor Unit Price  Qty/Unit Total Price  Attch.  Docs

KIESLERS POLICE SUPPLY  First Offer - $0.00   20 / each $0.00    Y

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 
Vendor Notes:
NO BID   

Safety and Security International  First Offer - $1.00   20 / each $20.00    Y

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 
Vendor Notes:
This comfort system helmet suspension system is 
just $1.00 when the Bell Pro Police BA3A is 
purchased above.   

Helmet Pro  First Offer - $38.50   20 / each $770.00    Y

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: BA/3A Comfort
Vendor Notes:
 

Galls  First Offer - $39.00   20 / each $780.00    Y

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: ZU596
Vendor Notes:
14-21 day lead time. Special order item.   

Lous Police Security Equipment  First Offer - $39.98   20 / each $799.60    Y

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 3S
Vendor Notes:
BIDDING: PROTECH 3-POINT SUSPENSION SYSTEM 
UPGRADE   

worldwide tactical LLC  First Offer - $130.00   20 / each $2,600.00    Y

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: BLSS SYSTEM
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Vendor Notes:
 

Lawmens & Shooters Supply, Inc. [Ad]
 

 
First Offer - $140.40   20 / each $2,808.00    Y

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 
Vendor Notes:
RBR Armor   

Botach Tactical [Ad]   First Offer - $146.00   20 / each $2,920.00    Y

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 
Vendor Notes:
 

Evergreen Specialty Services  First Offer - $160.00   20 / each $3,200.00    Y

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 
Vendor Notes:
Price is for item as spec'd   

 662-9335-1-05   Reflex Sight for MP-5

 Vendor Unit Price  Qty/Unit Total Price  Attch.  Docs

Galls  First Offer - $0.00   2 / each $0.00    Y

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 
Vendor Notes:
Not available.   

Safety and Security International  First Offer - $0.00   2 / each $0.00    Y

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 
Vendor Notes:
no bid this item   

Lawmens & Shooters Supply, Inc. [Ad]
 

 
First Offer - $314.28   2 / each $628.56    Y

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: RX01-17
Vendor Notes:
Trijicon   

worldwide tactical LLC  First Offer - $319.00   2 / each $638.00    Y

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: RX-01-107
Vendor Notes:
 

Law Enforcement Sales, USA  First Offer - $328.75   2 / each $657.50    Y

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: RX01-17
Vendor Notes:
Includes Mounts   

Lous Police Security Equipment  First Offer - $329.00   2 / each $658.00    Y

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 
Vendor Notes:
 

KIESLERS POLICE SUPPLY  First Offer - $354.00   2 / each $708.00    Y

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: RX-01-17
Vendor Notes:
TRIJICON   

 662-9335-1-06   Reflex Site for AR-15

 Vendor Unit Price  Qty/Unit Total Price  Attch.  Docs

Galls  First Offer - $0.00   3 / each $0.00    Y

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 
Vendor Notes:
Not available.   

Lawmens & Shooters Supply, Inc. [Ad]
 

 
First Offer - $274.34   3 / each $823.02    Y

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: RX01-25
Vendor Notes:
Trijicon   
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worldwide tactical LLC  First Offer - $336.00   3 / each $1,008.00    Y

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: RX-01-10
Vendor Notes:
 

Lous Police Security Equipment  First Offer - $379.00   3 / each $1,137.00    Y

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 
Vendor Notes:
 

Law Enforcement Sales, USA  First Offer - $379.10   3 / each $1,137.30    Y

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: RX01-10
Vendor Notes:
 

KIESLERS POLICE SUPPLY  First Offer - $390.00   3 / each $1,170.00    Y

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: RX-01-10
Vendor Notes:
TRIJICON   

 662-9335-1-07   Chemical Suit

 Vendor Unit Price  Qty/Unit Total Price  Attch.  Docs

KIESLERS POLICE SUPPLY  First Offer - $0.00   5 / each $0.00    Y

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 
Vendor Notes:
NO BID   

Galls  First Offer - $0.00   5 / each $0.00    Y

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 
Vendor Notes:
Not available.   

Global Protection, LLC  First Offer - $238.89   5 / each $1,194.45    Y

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 
Vendor Notes:
Lanx CPO-NFR-M 
Tiger Stripe discontinued available in 
woodland camo, desert camo, navy, black, safety 
orange or white   

Botach Tactical [Ad]   First Offer - $241.95   5 / each $1,209.75    Y

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 
Vendor Notes:
 

Lawmens & Shooters Supply, Inc. [Ad]
 

 
First Offer - $274.44   5 / each $1,372.20    Y

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: CPO Suit
Vendor Notes:
Lanx - available in woodland camo, desert camo, 
navy blue, black & white. They no longer make it in 
tiger stripe.   

worldwide tactical LLC  First Offer - $305.00   5 / each $1,525.00    Y

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: LANX CPO SUIT
Vendor Notes:
 

 662-9335-1-08   Chemical Suit
 Vendor Unit Price  Qty/Unit Total Price  Attch.  Docs

KIESLERS POLICE SUPPLY  First Offer - $0.00   10 / each $0.00    Y

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 
Vendor Notes:
NO BID   

Galls  First Offer - $0.00   10 / each $0.00    Y

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 
Vendor Notes:
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Not available.   

Global Protection, LLC  First Offer - $238.89   10 / each $2,388.90    Y

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 
Vendor Notes:
Lanx CPO-NFR-L 
Tiger Stripe discontinued available in 
woodland camo, desert camo, navy, black, safety 
orange or white   

Botach Tactical [Ad]   First Offer - $241.95   10 / each $2,419.50    Y

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 
Vendor Notes:
 

Lawmens & Shooters Supply, Inc. [Ad]
 

 
First Offer - $274.44   10 / each $2,744.40    Y

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: CPO Suit
Vendor Notes:
Lanx - available in woodland camo, desert camo, 
navy blue, black & white. They no longer make it in 
tiger stripe.   

worldwide tactical LLC  First Offer - $305.00   10 / each $3,050.00    Y

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: LANX CPO SUIT
Vendor Notes:
 

 662-9335-1-09   Chemical Suit
 Vendor Unit Price  Qty/Unit Total Price  Attch.  Docs

KIESLERS POLICE SUPPLY  First Offer - $0.00   5 / each $0.00    Y

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 
Vendor Notes:
NO BID   

Galls  First Offer - $0.00   5 / each $0.00    Y

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 
Vendor Notes:
Not available.   

Global Protection, LLC  First Offer - $261.11   5 / each $1,305.55    Y

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 
Vendor Notes:
Lanx CPO-NFR-XL 
Tiger Stripe discontinued available in 
woodland camo, desert camo, navy, black, safety 
orange or white   

Botach Tactical [Ad]   First Offer - $266.95   5 / each $1,334.75    Y

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 
Vendor Notes:
 

Lawmens & Shooters Supply, Inc. [Ad]
 

 
First Offer - $301.81   5 / each $1,509.05    Y

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: CPO Suit
Vendor Notes:
Lanx - available in woodland camo, desert camo, 
navy blue, black & white. They no longer make it in 
tiger stripe.   

worldwide tactical LLC  First Offer - $333.00   5 / each $1,665.00    Y

Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: LANX CPO SUIT
Vendor Notes:
 

Vendor Totals

 KIESLERS POLICE SUPPLY $3,890.50   
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Bid Contact VANESSA C MATTINGLY 
VMATTINGLY@KIESLER.COM
Ph 812-288-5740 x158   
Fax 812-288-7560 

Address 3300 Industrial Parkway
JEFFERSONVILLE, IN 47130 

Agency Notes: Vendor Notes:

 Galls $8,915.00   

Bid Contact Audra Meighan 
meighan-audra@galls.com
Ph 800-876-4242 x2175   

Address 2680 Palumbo Drive
Lexington, KY 40509 

Bid Notes  For over thirty-five years Galls has been dedicated to men and women in Public Safety and 
we continue to provide the best selection, best prices, and best service possible. With our 
award-winning catalog, convenient online ordering, dedicated sales representatives, and 
regional sales representatives we're here when you need us. 

Galls provides personalized service backed by the largest selection of in-stock merchandise 
in the industry, on-site custom embroidery and uniform production departments, same day 
shipping with standard two-day delivery, and most importantly a “NO HASSLE GUARANTEE”
on every purchase made. We can also offer samples and departmental and personal order 
discounts to all employees of the City of Fort Lauderdale. 

Thank you for the opportunity to participate in this RFP. Whatever the outcome, we look 
forward to further developing our relationship with all of Fort Lauderdale's departments and 
employees. 

Agency Notes: Vendor Notes:
For over thirty-five years Galls has been dedicated to 
men and women in Public Safety and we continue to 
provide the best selection, best prices, and best service 
possible. With our award-winning catalog, convenient 
online ordering, dedicated sales representatives, and 
regional sales representatives we're here when you 
need us. 

Galls provides personalized service backed by the 
largest selection of in-stock merchandise in the 
industry, on-site custom embroidery and uniform 
production departments, same day shipping with 
standard two-day delivery, and most importantly a “NO 
HASSLE GUARANTEE" on every purchase made. We can 
also offer samples and departmental and personal order 
discounts to all employees of the City of Fort 
Lauderdale. 

Thank you for the opportunity to participate in this RFP. 
Whatever the outcome, we look forward to further 
developing our relationship with all of Fort Lauderdale's 
departments and employees. 

 Lawmens & Shooters Supply, Inc. [Ad]  $17,175.18   

Bid Contact Gail Walker-Keen 
gail@lawmens.net
Ph 800-562-5697 x218   

Address 7750 9th Street SW
Vero Beach, FL 32968 

Vendor Code 00001471

Agency Notes: Vendor Notes:

 worldwide tactical LLC $17,824.50   

Bid Contact michael diveroli 
wwtactical@yahoo.com
Ph 305-534-0777   

Address 925 41ST Ste 306
MIAMI BEACH, FL 33140 

Agency Notes: Vendor Notes:

 Martronics, Inc. $884.90   

Bid Contact charlie stinson 
martronics@mindspring.com
Ph 800-334-0342   
Fax 954-972-2088 

Address p.o. box 870607
morrow, GA 30287-0607 
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Vendor Code 00000685

Agency Notes: Vendor Notes:

 Safety and Security International $6,320.00   

Bid Contact Jenny Doan 
jenny@safetyandsecurityinternational.com
Ph 877-282-4536   

Address 1664 Mallory Ln.
Brentwood, TN 37027 

Agency Notes: Vendor Notes:

 Botach Tactical [Ad]  $14,593.50   

Bid Contact BK M Botach 
botach@yahoo.com
Ph 323-294-5555 x119   

Address 3423 west 43rd place
Los Angeles, CA 90008 

Vendor Code 00018401

Bid Notes  All prices quoted include shipping. No extra charges. Delivery within 8-10 weeks A.R.O. 

Agency Notes: Vendor Notes:
All prices quoted include shipping. No extra charges. 
Delivery within 8-10 weeks A.R.O. 

 Evergreen Specialty Services $8,554.50   

Bid Contact William R Phelan 
wrp07@msn.com
Ph 631-974-3010   

Address 6804 Springfield blvd
Bayside, NY 11364 

Agency Notes: Vendor Notes:

 Helmet Pro $5,066.00   

Bid Contact Tyler Kunz 
helmetpro@hotmail.com
Ph 208-847-2541   

Address 1010 Washington Street
Montpelier, ID 83254 

Vendor Code 00021677

Agency Notes: Vendor Notes:

 Global Protection, LLC $4,888.90   

Bid Contact Cyndi Dabravalskie 
cyndi@protectivesuits.com
Ph 800-957-8955   

Address 5 Stow Road, Suite H
Marlton, NJ 08053 

Agency Notes: Vendor Notes:

 Law Enforcement Sales, USA $4,190.30   

Bid Contact Arnold B Freeman 
afreeman@pics.net
Ph 806-891-8911   

Address 703 S. 1st St.
Ste. 4
Lamesa, TX 79331 

Qualifications  WBE   

Agency Notes: Vendor Notes:

 Product Wizard $859.50   

Bid Contact Michelle Hermelee 
USBids@gmail.com
Ph 732-477-9119   

Address 259 Drum Point Road 8
Brick, NJ 08723 

Qualifications  DBE   MBE   WBE   

Agency Notes: Vendor Notes:

 Lous Police Security Equipment $10,902.50   

Bid Contact Robert Riccobono 
Robert@louspolice.com
Ph 305-822-5362   

Address 4149 Palm Avenue
Hialeah, FL 33012 

Vendor Code 00021558

Qualifications  MBE   WBE   

Agency Notes: Vendor Notes:

 Pines Police Supply $2,470.00   

Bid Contact Ruben Zamora 
ppolicesupply@bellsouth.net
Ph 954-431-0063   

Address 911 NW 209 Ave , Bay109
Pembroke Pines, FL 33029 
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Vendor Code 00023052

Qualifications  MBE   WBE   

Agency Notes: Vendor Notes:

 W.S. Darley & Co. $960.00   

Bid Contact R.C> Darley 
regdarley@darley.com
Ph 708-345-8050   

Address 2000 Anson Drive
Melrose Park, IL 60160 

Vendor Code 00001890

Agency Notes: Vendor Notes:

**All bids/proposals submitted for the designated project are reflected on this tabulation sheet.  However, the listing of the 
bid/proposal on this tabulation sheet shall not be construed as a comment on the responsiveness of such bid/proposal or as any 
indication that the agency accepts such bid/proposal as being responsive.  The agency will make a determination as to the 
responsiveness of the vendor responses submitted based upon compliance with all applicable laws, purchasing guidelines and 
project documents, including but not limited to the project specifications and contract documents.  The agency will notify the 
successful vendor upon award of the contract and, as according to the law, all bid/proposal responses received will be available 
for inspection at that time. 
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