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BID TABULATION FOR BID 183-9846
Fire Station 47 Bid Tabulation

Office Office Workplace Workplace Workscapes Workscapes
Elements Elements Resource Resource Inc. Inc.

Item # Mfg. QTY. Description Cost Total Cost Total Cost Total

1 NL2 4 WV2454WSSL Waveworks, 24DX54W, Surface, 102.00$    408.00$       102.00$     408.00$         102.00$       408.00$            
2 NL2 4 WV2472WSSL Waveworks, 24DX72W, Surface, 130.80$       523.20$       138.80$     555.20$         130.80$       523.20$            
3 NL2 20 CBV2128CL1 Waveworks, 21WX28H, Table base 70.40$         1,408.00$    70.40$       1,408.00$      70.40$         1,408.00$         
4 NL1 20 N60AA Tag, Side, Arms 107.60$       2,152.00$    107.60$     2,152.00$      107.60$       2,152.00$         
5 NL1 10 N69BB Medalist, Traditional, Hi-Back, 445.60$       4,456.00$    443.60$     4,436.00$      443.60$       4,436.00$         
6 NL2 1 CP-R120EHN Conf. Table, 48DX120W, Top, 383.60$       383.60$       383.60$     383.60$         383.60$       383.60$            
7 NL2 3 BP-16HN Conf. Table, 16Wx27H, Base, 206.00$       618.00$       206.00$     618.00$         206.00$       618.00$            
8 NL1 3 N45DD Cinch, Plastic Stacker, 228.00$       684.00$       228.00$     684.00$         228.00$       684.00$            
9 NL1 3 N80AA Result, High Back, Swival Tilt 220.40$       661.20$       220.40$     661.20$         220.40$       661.20$            

10 NL1 6 N60AA Tag, Side, Arms 107.60$       645.60$       107.60$     645.60$         107.60$       645.60$            
11 NL2 1 21-3066LHHN Arrowwood, 30DX66W, Desk, 444.80$       444.80$       444.80$     444.80$         444.80$       444.80$            
12 NL2 2 21-3066RHHN Arrowwood, 30DX66W, Desk, 444.80$       889.60$       444.80$     889.60$         444.80$       889.60$            
13 NL2 2 21-2448LHHN Arrowood, 24DX48W, Return, Left 290.00$       580.00$       290.00$     580.00$         290.00$       580.00$            
14 NL2 1 21-2448RHHN Arrowood, 24DX48W, Return, Right 290.00$       290.00$       290.00$     290.00$         290.00$       290.00$            
15 NL2 3 21-3366BCOH Arrowwood, 33DX66H, Bookcase, 261.60$       784.80$       261.60$     784.80$         261.60$       784.80$            

SUBTOTAL SECTION 1 14,928.80$      14,940.80$       14,908.80$       

16 NL2 3 NCG26057010 Special  Indiv. Locking, Drawers, 646.40$       1,939.20$    969.60$     2,908.80$      646.40$       1,939.20$         
17 NL2 3 WV36CW4M Waveworks, Counterweight, 47.20$         141.60$       70.80$       212.40$         47.20$         141.60$            

SUBTOTAL SECTION 2, OPTION A 2,080.80$        3,121.20$         2,080.80$         

18 MER 3 26-3618-4 +Lateral File Std Pull 4-high 524.48$       1,573.44$    600.41$     1,801.23$      
SUBTOTAL SECTION 2, OPTION B 1,573.44$        1,801.23$         No Bid

19 HAO 1 A1311.A +Duplex Rcp, 4 Circ A 6/pkg. 42.54$         42.54$         42.54$       42.54$           
20 HAO 1 A1311.B +Duplex Rcp, 4 Circ B 6/pkg. 42.54$         42.54$         42.54$       42.54$           
21 HAO 2 A1322.06E +BASE Pwr Entry, Dir Con 4-Circ, 36.76$         73.52$         33.88$       67.76$           
22 HAO 4 AO215.34 *Draw Rod 34H 4.73$           18.92$         4.46$         17.84$           
23 HAO 4 AO215.48 *Draw Rod 48H 4.99$           19.96$         4.73$         18.92$           
24 HAO 4 A1120.3930E +Panel, Fabric Pwr 4-Circ 136.81$       547.24$       127.62$     510.48$         
25 HAO 4 A1120.3942E +Panel, Fabric Pwr 4-Circ 155.98$       623.92$       145.74$     582.96$         
26 HAO 8 A1120.5330N +Panel,Fabric Npwr 53H 30W 112.13$       897.04$       104.78$     838.24$         
27 HAO 4 A1120.5336N +Panel,Fabric Npwr 53H 36W 131.30$       525.20$       122.63$     490.52$         
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Office Office Workplace Workplace Workscapes Workscapes
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28 HAO 6 A1220.53H +Conn,2-Way 90 Deg hard 53H 29.41$         176.46$       27.84$       167.04$         
29 HAO 2 A1230.53H +Conn,3-Way 90 Deg hard 53H 51.99$         103.98$       49.11$       98.22$           
30 HAO 2 A1250.39H +Fin End 39H 11.03$         22.06$         10.24$       20.48$           
31 HAO 4 A1230.53.H +Fin End 53H 12.08$         48.32$         11.29$       45.16$           
32 HAO 6 AO259. +Fin End, Chg-Of-Ht, Panel/Conn 5.51$           33.06$         4.99$         29.94$           
33 HAO 4 A2310.2442L +Wk Surf, Sq-Edge Rect Lam 83.77$         335.08$       83.77$       335.08$         
34 HAO 4 A2310.3066L +Wk Surf, Sq-Edge Rect Lam 149.42$       597.68$       149.42$     597.68$         

SUBTOTAL SECTION 3 4,107.52$        3,905.40$         No Bid

35 NL1 4 N80AA Result, High Back, Swivel Tilt 220.40$       881.60$       220.40$     881.60$         210.00$       840.00$            
SUBTOTAL SECTION 4 881.60$           881.60$            840.00$            

36 NL2 3 WV1836LFF4M Waveworks, 18Dx36W, Lateral File, 646.40$       1,939.20$    558.00$     1,674.00$      372.00$       1,116.00$         
37 NL2 3 WV36CW4M Waveworks, Counterweight, 47.20$         141.60$       70.80$       212.40$         47.20$         141.60$            

SUBTOTAL SECTION 5, OPTION A 2,080.80$       1,886.40$        1,257.60$        

38 MER 3 26-3618-4 +Lateral File Std Pull 4-high 524.48$       1,573.44$    600.41$     1,801.23$      
SUBTOTAL SECTION 5, OPTION B 1,573.44$       1,801.23$        No Bid

NATIONAL SUBTOTAL, SECTION 1 14,928.80$      14,940.80$       14,908.80$       
NATIONAL SUBTOTAL, SECTION 2, OPTION A 2,080.80$        3,121.20$         2,080.80$         
NATIONAL SUBTOTAL, SECTION 4 881.60$           881.60$            840.00$            
NATIONAL SUBTOTAL, SECTION 5, OPTION A 2,080.80$        1,886.40$         1,257.60$         
INSTALLATION/DELIVERY, INCLUDING SECTION 2 & 5 1,327.00$        2,303.35$         1,685.00$         
INSTALLATION/DELIVERY, NOT INCLUDING SECTION 2 & 5 1,282.00$        1,755.65$         1,500.00$         
STORAGE COSTS FOR DELAYED SHIPMENTS -$                1,250.00$         600.00$            

HERMAN MILLER SUBTOTAL, SECTION 2, OPTION B 1,573.44$        1,801.23$         No Bid
HERMAN MILLER SUBTOTAL, SECTION 3 4,107.52$        3,905.40$         No Bid
HERMAN MILLER SUBTOTAL, SECTION 5, OPTION B 1,573.44$        1,801.23$         No Bid
INSTALLATION/DELIVERY, INCLUDING SECTION 2 & 5 515.00$           823.57 No Bid
INSTALLATION/DELIVERY, NOT INCLUDING SECTION 2 & 5 470.00$           483.34 No Bid
STORAGE COSTS FOR DELAYED SHIPMENTS -$                625.00$            No Bid
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FINAL COST ANALYSIS FIRE STATION 47

NATIONAL SUBTOTAL, SECTION 1 14,928.80$      14,940.80$       14,908.80$       
NATIONAL SUBTOTAL, SECTION 4 881.60$           881.60$            840.00$            
INSTALLATION/DEL. NOT INCLUDING SECTIONS 2 & 5 OPTION A 1,282.00$        1,755.65$         1,500.00$         
STORAGE COSTS FOR DELAYED SHIPMENTS -$                1,250.00$         600.00$            
TOTAL COST FOR NATIONAL FURNITURE STATION 47 17,092.40$     18,828.05$      17,848.80$      

HERMAN MILLER SUBTOTAL, SECTION 2, OPTION B 1,573.44$        1,801.23$         
HERMAN MILLER SUBTOTAL, SECTION 3 4,107.52$        3,905.40$         
HERMAN MILLER SUBTOTAL, SECTION 5, OPTION B 1,573.44$        1,801.23$         
INSTALLATION/DELIVERY, INCLUDING SECTION 2 & 5 515.00$           823.57$            
STORAGE COSTS FOR DELAYED SHIPMENTS -$                625.00$            
TOTAL COST FOR HERMAN MILLER FURNITURE STATION 47 7,769.40$       8,956.43$        No Bid
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Fire Station 53 Bid Tabulation
Office Office Workplace Workplace Workscapes Workscapes
Elements Elements Resource Resource Inc. Inc.

Item # Mfg. QTY. Description Cost Total Cost Total Cost Total

1 NL1 2 N60AA Tag, Side, Arms 107.60$       215.20$       107.60$     215.20$         104.40$       208.80$            
2 NL2 1 1669TB25105 Accessories, 66W, Tackboard 110.40$       110.40$       110.40$     110.40$         110.40$       110.40$            
3 NL2 1 21-1572OSCM Arrowood, 24DX72W, Highback, 346.00$       346.00$       346.00$     346.00$         339.20$       339.20$            
4 NL2 1 21-2448UPMC Arrowood, 24DX48W, Bridge, 125.60$       125.60$       125.60$     125.60$         123.20$       123.20$            
5 NL2 1 21-2472LPCM Arrowood, 24DX72W, Credenza, 464.80$       464.80$       464.80$     464.80$         455.60$       455.60$            
6 NL2 1 21-3366BCOM Arrowood, 33DX66H, Bookcase, 261.60$       261.60$       261.60$     261.60$         256.40$       256.40$            
7 NL2 1 21-3672RHMC Arrowood, 36DX72W, Desk, 475.60$       475.60$       475.60$     475.60$         466.40$       466.40$            
8 NL1 1 N80AA Result, High Back, Swivel Tilt 220.40$       220.40$       220.40$     220.40$         210.00$       210.00$            
9 NL2 1 CP-R72EMC Conf. Table, 60X72W, Top, 206.00$       206.00$       206.00$     206.00$         200.00$       200.00$            

10 NL2 2 BP-16MC Conf. Table, 16WX27H, Base, 206.00$       412.00$       206.00$     412.00$         200.00$       400.00$            
11 NL2 2 21-3366BCOM Arrowood, 33DX66H, Bookcase, 261.60$       523.20$       261.60$     523.20$         256.40$       512.80$            
12 NL1 6 N80AA Result, High Back, Swivel Tilt 220.40$       1,322.40$    220.40$     1,322.40$      210.00$       1,260.00$         
13 NL2 2 WV2472WSSL Waveworks, 24D72W, Surface, 130.80$       261.60$       130.80$     261.60$         128.40$       256.80$            
14 NL2 4 CBV2128CL1 Waveworks, 21WX28H, Table 70.40$         281.60$       70.40$       281.60$         68.40$         273.60$            
15 NL2 10 21-3366BCOM Arrowood, 33DX66H, Bookcase, 261.60$       2,616.00$    261.60$     2,616.00$      256.40$       2,564.00$         
16 NL1 4 N35BAS Fuel, Mid Back, Armless, Plastic 240.00$       960.00$       240.00$     960.00$         240.00$       960.00$            

SUBTOTAL, SECTION 1 8,802.40$        8,802.40$         8,597.20$         

17 HAO 1 A1311.A +Duplex Rcp, 4-Circ A 6/pkg 42.54$         42.54$         42.54$       42.54$           
18 HAO 1 A1311.B +Duplex Rcp, 4-Circ B 6/pkg 42.54$         42.54$         42.54$       42.54$           
19 HAO 3 A1322.06E *Base Pwr Entry, Dir Con 4-Circ, 36.76$         110.28$       33.88$       101.64$         
20 HAO 6 A3410.1624 +Tackboard, B-Style 16H 24W 35.98$         215.88$       33.88$       203.28$         
21 HAO 3 A3410.1642 +Tackboard, B-Style 16H 42W 42.28$         126.84$       39.92$       119.76$         
22 HAO 3 A3410.1648 +Tackboard, B-Style 16H 48W 44.90$         134.70$       42.54$       127.62$         
23 HAO 7 AO215.48 *Draw Rod 48H 4.99$           34.93$         4.73$         33.11$           
24 HAO 6 AO215.62 *Draw Rod 62H 4.99$           29.94$         4.73$         28.38$           
25 HAO 6 A1120.5324N +Panel, Fabric, Npwr 53H 24W 98.74$         592.44$       92.17$       553.02$         
26 HAO 14 A1120.5336N +Panel, Fabric Npwr 53H 36W 131.30$       1,838.20$    122.63$     1,716.82$      
27 HAO 6 A1120.6724E +Panel, Fabric Pwr 4-Circ 67H 24W 151.52$       909.12$       141.54$     849.24$         
28 HAO 3 A1120.6742E +Panel, Fabric Pwr 4-Circ 67H 42W 195.90$       587.70$       183.03$     549.09$         
29 HAO 3 A1120.6748E +Panel, Fabric Pwr 4-Circ 67H 48W 206.67$       620.01$       193.01$     579.03$         
30 HAO 6 A1220.53H +Comm, 2-Way 90 Deg Hard 53H 29.41$         176.46$       27.84$       167.04$         
31 HAO 4 A1220.67H +Comm, 2-Way 90 Deg Hard 67H 32.04$         128.16$       30.20$       120.80$         
32 HAO 3 A1230.67H +Comm, 3Way 90 Deg Hard 67H 56.72$         170.16$       53.57$       160.71$         
33 HAO 7 A1230.53H +Fin End 53H 12.08$         84.56$         11.29$       79.03$           
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34 HAO 2 A1250.67H +Fin End 67H 12.34$         24.68$         11.55$       23.10$           
35 HAO 3 A2310.2442L +Wk Surf, Sq-Edge Rect Lam 83.77$         251.31$       83.77$       251.31$         
36 HAO 3 A2310.2448L +Wk Surf, Sq-Edge Rect Lam 87.97$         263.91$       87.97$       263.91$         
37 HAO 6 A2310.2472L +Wk Surf, Sq-Edge Rect Lam 132.35$       794.10$       132.35$     794.10$         
38 HAO 2 A2380.24L +Support panel, Wk Surf, 66.70$         133.40$       66.70$       133.40$         
39 HAO 6 A3352.1324 +Flip Dr Unit, B-Style Fab, 101.36$       608.16$       96.37$       578.22$         
40 HAO 3 A3352.1342 +Flip Dr. Unit, B-Style Fab, 123.68$       371.04$       117.64$     352.92$         
41 HAO 3 A3352.1348 +Flip Dr. Unit, B-Style Fab, 130.25$       390.75$       123.95$     371.85$         
42 HAO 7 AO259. +Fin End, Chg-Of-Ht, Panel/Comm 5.51$           38.57$         4.99$         34.93$           
43 HFS 6 FAV10.2415B +Ped V-Pull, Freestd 24D F/F, 155.75$       934.50$       155.75$     934.50$         
44 HFS 6 FAV10.2415F +Ped V-Pull, Freestd 24D B/B/F, 169.75$       1,018.50$    169.75$     1,018.50$      
45 HMU 6 G6120.24NS +Task Light, E.E., No Dim, 64.60$         387.60$       61.19$       367.14$         
46 HMU 3 G6120.42NS +Task Light, E.E., No Dim 71.95$         215.85$       68.01$       204.03$         
47 HMU 3 G6120.48NS +Task Light, E.E., No Dim 73.27$         219.81$       69.33$       207.99$         

SUBTOTAL, SECTION 2 11,496.64$      11,009.55$       No Bid

48 NL1 6 N80AA Result, High Back, Swivel Tilt 220.40$       1,322.40$    220.40$     1,322.40$      210.00$       1,260.00$         
SUBTOTAL, SECTION 3 1,322.40$        1,322.40$         1,260.00$         

49 NL2 1 21-3672LHHN Arrowood, 36DX72W, Desk, 475.60$       475.60$       475.60$     475.60$         466.40$       466.40$            
50 NL2 1 21-2448RHHN Arrowood, 24DX48W, Return, Right, 290.00$       290.00$       290.00$     290.00$         284.40$       284.40$            
51 NL2 1 21-1572OSCH Arrowood, 15DX72W, Highback 346.00$       346.00$       346.00$     346.00$         339.20$       339.20$            
52 NL2 1 21-2436LFHN Arrowood, 24DX36W, Lateral File, 290.00$       290.00$       290.00$     290.00$         284.40$       284.40$            
53 NL2 1 WV3038BCOL Waveworks, 30Wx38H, Bookcase, 148.40$       148.40$       148.40$     148.40$         145.60$       145.60$            
54 NL1 1 N80AA Result, High Back, Swivel Tilt 220.40$       220.40$       220.40$     220.40$         210.00$       210.00$            
55 NL1 2 N60AA Tag, Side, Arms 107.60$       215.20$       107.60$     215.20$         104.40$       208.80$            
56 NL2 1 1669TB25105 Accessories, 66W, Tackboard, 110.40$       110.40$       110.40$     110.40$         110.40$       110.40$            
57 NL2 6 WV1836LFF4M Waveworks, 18DX36W, Lateral File, 372.00$       2,232.00$    558.00$     3,348.00$      372.00$       2,232.00$         
58 NL2 6 WV36CW4M Waveworks, Counterweight, 47.20$         283.20$       70.80$       424.80$         47.20$         283.20$            
59 NL2 6 NCCB001 Casegoods, Lock Core & Key, 4.40$           26.40$         4.40$         26.40$           4.40$           26.40$              
60 NL2 1 21-3672RHMC Arrowood, 36DX72W, Desk, 475.60$       475.60$       475.60$     475.60$         466.40$       466.40$            
61 NL2 1 21-2448UPMC Arrowood, 24DX48W, Bridge, Amber 125.60$       125.60$       125.60$     125.60$         123.20$       123.20$            
62 NL2 1 21-2472LP2MC Arrowood, 24DX72W, Credenza, 447.20$       447.20$       447.20$     447.20$         438.40$       438.40$            
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63 NL2 1 21-1572OSCM Arrowood, 15DX72W, Highback 346.00$       346.00$       346.00$     346.00$         339.20$       339.20$            
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64 NL2 1 1669TB25105 Accessories, 66W, Tackboard, 110.40$       110.40$       110.40$     110.40$         110.40$       110.40$            
65 NL2 1 21-2436LFMC Arrowood, 24DX36W, Lateral File 290.00$       290.00$       290.00$     290.00$         284.40$       284.40$            
66 NL2 1 WV3038BCOL Waveworks, 30WX38H, Bookcase, 148.40$       148.40$       148.40$     148.40$         145.60$       145.60$            
67 NL2 1 21-3366BCOM Arrowood, 33DX66H, Bookcase, 261.60$       261.60$       261.60$     261.60$         256.40$       256.40$            
68 NL2 1 C4MCFR Universal, 21DX36WX57H, Lateral 616.80$       616.80$       616.80$     616.80$         598.80$       598.80$            
69 NL1 1 N80AA Result, High Back, Swivel, Tilt 220.40$       220.40$       220.40$     220.40$         210.00$       210.00$            
70 NL1 2 N60AA Tag, Side Arms 107.60$       215.20$       107.60$     215.20$         104.40$       208.80$            
71 NL2 2 NCCBMK Casegoods, Lock Core, Style B, 4.40$           8.80$           4.40$         8.80$             4.40$           8.80$                
72 NL2 6 NCCB010 Casegoods, Lock Core & Key 4.40$           26.40$         4.40$         26.40$           4.40$           26.40$              
73 NL2 4 NCCB011 Casegoods, Lock Core & Key 4.40$           17.60$         4.40$         17.60$           4.40$           17.60$              
74 NL2 4 NCCB012 Casegoods, Lock Core & Key 4.40$           17.60$         4.40$         17.60$           4.40$           17.60$              
75 NL2 1 CP-R144EHN Conf Table, 48DX144W, Top, 464.40$       464.40$       464.40$     464.40$         450.80$       450.80$            
76 NL2 3 BP-16HN Conf Table, 16WX27H, Base, 206.00$       618.00$       206.00$     618.00$         200.00$       600.00$            
77 NL1 4 N45DD Cinch, Plastic Stacker, Armless, 228.00$       912.00$       228.00$     912.00$         228.00$       912.00$            
78 NL1 13 N69BB Medalist, Traditional, Hi-Back, 445.60$       5,792.80$    443.60$     5,766.80$      443.60$       5,766.80$         
79 NL2 2 21-2448LHHN Arrowood, 24DX48W, Return, Left, 290.00$       580.00$       290.00$     580.00$         284.40$       568.80$            
80 NL2 1 21-2448RHHN Arrowood, 24DX48W, Return, Right, 290.00$       290.00$       290.00$     290.00$         284.40$       284.40$            
81 NL2 1 21-3066LHHN Arrowood, 30DX66W, Desk, 444.80$       444.80$       444.80$     444.80$         436.00$       436.00$            
82 NL2 2 21-3066RHHN Arrowood, 30DX66W, Desk, 444.80$       889.60$       444.80$     889.60$         436.00$       872.00$            
83 NL1 3 N80AA Result, High Back, Swivel Tilt 220.00$       660.00$       220.40$     661.20$         210.00$       630.00$            
84 NL1 6 N60AA Tag, Side, Arms 107.60$       645.60$       107.60$     645.60$         104.40$       626.40$            

SUBTOTAL, SECTION 4 19,262.40$      20,495.20$       18,990.00$       

85 NL2 3 NCG26057010 Special Locking File, 4 Dwr, 36W 646.40$       1,939.20$    969.60$     2,908.80$      646.40$       1,939.20$         
86 NL2 3 WV36CW4M Waveworks, Counterweight, 47.20$         141.60$       70.80$       212.40$         47.20$         141.60$            

SUBTOTAL, SECTION 5, OPTION A 2,080.80$        3,121.20$         2,080.80$         

87 MER 3 26-3618-4 +Lateral File Std Pull 4-high 524.48$       1,573.44$    466.43$     1,399.29$      
SUBTOTAL, SECTION 5, OPTION B 1,573.44$        1,399.29$         No Bid
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88 HAO 1 A1311.A +Duplex Rcp, 4-Circ A 6/Pkg 42.54$         42.54$         42.54$       42.54$           
89 HAO 2 A1322.06E *Base Pwr Entry, Dir Con 4-Circ, 36.76$         73.52$         33.88$       67.76$           
90 HAO 5 AO215.34 *Draw Rod 34H 4.73$           23.65$         4.46$         22.30$           
91 HAO 2 A1120.3930N +Panel, Fabric Npwr 39H 30W 99.79$         199.58$       93.22$       186.44$         
92 HAO 6 A1120.3936E +Panel, Fabric Pwr 4-Circ 149.68$       898.08$       139.70$     838.20$         
93 HAO 2 A1120.3936N +Panel, Fabric Npwr 39H 36W 112.92$       225.84$       105.30$     210.60$         
94 HAO 1 A1120.3942E +Panel, Fabric Pwr 4-Circ 155.98$       155.98$       145.74$     145.74$         
95 HAO 2 A1120.6748N +Panel, Fabric Npwr 67H 48W 169.64$       339.28$       158.35$     316.70$         
96 HAO 2 A1220.39H +Conn, 2-Way 90 Deg Hard 39H 24.95$         49.90$         22.63$       45.26$           
97 HAO 2 A1230.67H +Conn, 3-way 90 Deg Hard 67H 56.72$         113.44$       53.57$       107.14$         
98 HAO 4 A1250.39H +Fin End 39H 11.03$         44.12$         10.24$       40.96$           
99 HAO 2 A1250.67H +Fin End 67H 12.34$         24.68$         11.55$       23.10$           

100 HAO 4 AO259. +Fin End, Chg-Of-Ht, Panel/Conn 5.51$           22.04$         4.99$         19.96$           
101 HAO 1 A2310.3042L +Wk Surf, Sq-Edge Rect Lam 104.78$       104.78$       104.78$     104.78$         
102 HAO 4 A2310.3072L +Wk Surf, Sq-Edge Rect Lam 164.91$       659.64$       164.91$     659.64$         
103 HAO 2 A2380.30L +Support Panel, Wk Surf, 75.37$         150.74$       75.37$       150.74$         

SUBTOTAL, SECTION 6 3,127.81$        2,981.86$         No Bid

104 NL1 4 N35BAS Fuel, Mid back, Armless, Plastic 240.00$       960.00$       240.00$     960.00$         240.00$       960.00$            
SUBTOTAL, SECTION 7 960.00$           960.00$            960.00$            

105 NL1 20 N60AA Tag, Side, Arms 107.60$       2,152.00$    107.60$     2,152.00$      104.40$       2,088.00$         
106 NL1 1 N60DO Tag, Transport Dolly, Hold 6 Chairs 162.40$       162.40$       162.40$     162.40$         157.60$       157.60$            
107 NL2 1 21-3066RHHN Arrowood, 30DX66W, Desk, 444.80$       444.80$       444.80$     444.80$         436.00$       436.00$            
108 NL2 1 21-2448LHHN Arrowood, 24DX48W, Return, Left, 290.00$       290.00$       290.00$     290.00$         284.40$       284.40$            
109 NL2 1 21-3366BCOH Arrowood, 33DX66H, BookCase, 261.60$       261.60$       261.60$     261.60$         256.40$       256.40$            
110 NL1 1 N80AA Result, High Back, Swivel Tilt 220.40$       220.40$       220.40$     220.40$         210.00$       210.00$            
111 NL1 2 N60AA Tag, Side, Arms 107.60$       215.20$       107.60$     215.20$         104.40$       208.80$            

SUBTOTAL, SECTION 8 3,746.40$        3,746.40$         3,641.20$         
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Fire Station 53 Bid Tabulation
Office Office Workplace Workplace Workscapes Workscapes
Elements Elements Resource Resource Inc. Inc.

Item # Mfg. QTY. Description Cost Total Cost Total Cost Total

112 NL2 1 NCG26057010 Special Indiv. Locking Drawers 646.40$       646.40$       969.60$     969.60$         646.40$       646.40$            
113 NL2 1 WV36CW4M Waveworks, Counterweight, 47.20$         47.20$         70.80$       70.80$           47.20$         47.20$              

SUBTOTAL, SECTION 9, OPTION A 693.60$           1,040.40$         693.60$            

114 MER 1 263-3618-4 +Lateral File Std Pull 4-high 524.48$       524.48$       466.43$     466.43$         
SUBTOTAL, SECTION 9, OPTION B 524.48$           466.43$            No Bid

115 NL2 3 WV1836LFF4M Waveworks, 18Dx36W, Lateral 372.00$       1,116.00$    558.00$     1,674.00$      372.00$       1,116.00$         
116 NL2 3 WV36CW4M Wavewor Waveworks, Counterweight, 47.20$         141.60$       70.80$       212.40$         47.20$         141.60$            

SUBTOTAL, SECTION 10, OPTION A 1,257.60$        1,886.40$         1,257.60$         

117 MER 3 26-3618-4 +Lateral File Std Pull 4-high 524.48$       1,573.44$    466.43$     1,399.29$      
SUBTOTAL, SECTION 10, OPTION B 1,573.44$        1,399.29$         No Bid

NATIONAL SUBTOTAL, SECTION 1 8,802.40$        8,802.40$         8,597.20$         
NATIONAL SUBTOTAL, SECTION 3 1,322.40$        1,322.40$         1,260.00$         
NATIONAL SUBTOTAL, SECTION 4 19,262.40$      20,495.20$       18,990.00$       
NATIONAL SUBTOTAL, SECTION 5, OPTION A 2,080.80$        3,121.20$         2,080.80$         
NATIONAL SUBTOTAL, SECTION 7 960.00$           960.00$            960.00$            
NATIONAL SUBTOTAL, SECTION 8 3,746.40$        3,746.40$         3,641.20$         
NATIONAL SUBTOTAL, SECTION 9, OPTION A 693.60$           1,040.40$         693.60$            
NATIONAL SUBTOTAL, SECTION 10, OPTION A 1,257.60$        1,886.40$         1,257.60$         
INSTALLATION/DEL. INCLUDING SECTIONS 5,9 & 10, OPTION A 2,050.00$        4,453.67$         3,880.00$         
INSTALLATION/DEL. NOT INCLUDING SECTIONS 5,9 & 10, OPTION A 1,935.00$        3,812.29$         3,720.00$         
STORAGE COSTS FOR DELAYED SHIPMENTS -$                3,000.00$         1,200.00$         

HERMAN MILLER SUBTOTAL, SECTION 2 11,496.64$      11,009.55$       No Bid
HERMAN MILLER SUBTOTAL, SECTION 5, OPTION B 1,573.44$        1,399.29$         No Bid
HERMAN MILLER SUBTOTAL, SECTION 6 3,127.81$        2,981.86$         No Bid
HERMAN MILLER, SUBTOTAL, SECTION 9, OPTION B 524.48$           466.43$            No Bid
HERMAN MILLER, SUBTOTAL, SECTION 10, OPTION B 1,573.44$        1,399.29$         No Bid
INSTALLATION/DEL. INCLUDING SECTIONS 5,9 & 10, OPTION B 1,095.00$        1,974.70$         No Bid



INSTALLATION/DEL. NOT INCLUDING SECTIONS 5,9 & 10, OPTION B 990.00$           1,660.32$         No Bid
STORAGE COSTS FOR DELAYED SHIPMENTS -$                1,250.00$         No Bid

Fire Station 53 Bid Tabulation
Office Office Workplace Workplace Workscapes Workscapes
Elements Elements Resource Resource Inc. Inc.

Item # Mfg. QTY. Description Cost Total Cost Total Cost Total

FINAL COST ANALYSIS FIRE STATION 53

NATIONAL SUBTOTAL, SECTION 1 8,802.40$        8,802.40$         8,597.20$         
NATIONAL SUBTOTAL, SECTION 3 1,322.40$        1,322.40$         1,260.00$         
NATIONAL SUBTOTAL, SECTION 4 19,262.40$      20,495.00$       18,990.00$       
NATIONAL SUBTOTAL, SECTION 7 960.00$           960.00$            960.00$            
NATIONAL SUBTOTAL, SECTION 8 3,746.40$        3,746.40$         3,641.20$         
INSTALLATION/DEL. NOT INCLUDING SECTIONS 5,9 & 10, OPTION A 1,935.00$        3,812.29$         3,720.00$         
STORAGE COSTS FOR DELAYED SHIPMENTS -$                3,000.00$         1,200.00$         
TOTAL COST FOR NATIONAL FURNITURE STATION 53 36,028.60$     42,138.49$      38,368.40$      

HERMAN MILLER SUBTOTAL, SECTION 2 11,496.64$      11,009.55$       
HERMAN MILLER SUBTOTAL, SECTION 5, OPTION B 1,573.44$        1,399.29$         
HERMAN MILLER SUBTOTAL, SECTION 6 3,127.81$        2,981.86$         
HERMAN MILLER, SUBTOTAL, SECTION 9, OPTION B 524.48$           466.43$            
HERMAN MILLER, SUBTOTAL, SECTION 10, OPTION B 1,573.44$        1,399.29$         
INSTALLATION/DEL. INCLUDING SECTIONS 5,9 & 10, OPTION B 1,095.00$        1,974.70$         
STORAGE COSTS FOR DELAYED SHIPMENTS -$                1,250.00$         
TOTAL COST FOR HERMAN MILLER FURNITURE STATION 53 19,390.81$     20,481.12$      No Bid

TOTAL COST FOR STATION 47 ( NATIONAL) 17,092.40$     18,828.05$      17,848.80$      
TOTAL COST FOR STATION 53 (NATIONAL) 36,028.60$     42,138.49$      38,368.40$      
TOTAL COST FOR BOTH STATIONS (NATIONAL 53,121.00$     60,966.54$      56,217.20$      

TOTAL COST FOR STATION 47 (HERMAN MILLER) 7,769.40$       8,956.43$        No Bid
TOTAL COST FOR STATION 53 (HERMAN MILLER) 19,390.81$     20,481.12$      No Bid
TOTAL COST FOR BOTH STATIONS (HERMAN MILLER) 27,160.21$     29,437.55$      No Bid

TOTAL COST FOR NATIONAL AND HERMAN FURNITURE 
BOTH STATIONS 80,281.21$     90,404.09$      Only Bid
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